
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION OR PROPOSAL (RFQ/RFP) INVITATION OR BID
THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

SEND BIDS TO:

THE PUBLIC SCHOOLS OF
THE CITY OF ANN ARBOR
Balas Administration BUilding
2555 South State Street
Ann Arbor, MI48104

TO:

NOTE: FOR BID RESULTS AND AWARDS, CONTACT
NAME: Robert Allen
PHONE: 734-994-2250

Page 1 of 32

BID NUMBER: 13-001-610
Show this number in left hand 10
corner of bid envelope and mark
"DO NOT OPEN IN MAIL ROO "
We will NOT be responsible for I st or
misplaced envelopes that are not properly
marked

DATE OF ISSUE: Wednesday, jU9ust 8,2012

DATEITIME OF BID OPENING:
Wednesday, August 22,201210:00 am

PLACE, Balas Adm;n;~trat;on Bldg
2555 South Stilte Street
Ann Arbor, MI 48104

NOTICE: LATE BIDS WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED FOR AWARD
Please quote itemized prices and delivery dates. F.O.B. DESTINATION, Ann Arbor, MI. Original coPY must be returned to
us properly completed, duplicate to be retained for your file. The right is reserved by the Board of Education to reject any
or all quotations. Unless otherwise stated, we assume you will accept an order for any item quoted.~prices must be firm
for ninety (90) days from the presentation of the bid. If you are unable to perform as specified and a e authorized to offer
a substitute, brands must be clearly stated (please provide pictorial description of substituted items). This bid form is the
ONE and ONLY form that will be accepted as valid unless otherwise indicated. ADDITIONAL TERMS A 0 CONDITIONS ARE
PRINTED ON THE FOLLOWING PAGES, ARE INCORPORATED BY REFERENCE INTO THIS DOCUMENT, A 0 SHALL APPLY TO
ALL AGREEMENTS WITH THE PUBLIC SCHOOLS OF THE CITY OF ANN ARBOR. THIS RFQ, THE ATljACHED ADDITIONAL
TERMS AND CONDITIONS, THE PURCHASE ORDER, THE BID SPECIFICATIONS ISSUED BY THE PUBLIC SCHOOLS OF THE
CITY OF ANN ARBOR AND THE BID DOCUMENTS FROM THE BIDDER WHOSE SIGNATURE APPEIt\RS BELOW SHALL
CONSTITUTE THE ENTIRE CONTRACT BETWEEN THE PUBLIC SCHOOLS OF THE CITY OF ANN ARB<DR AND THE BIDDER
WITH RESPECT TO THE SUBJECT MATIER HEREOF. I

( ) Bid Bond Required. See Additional Terms &
Conditions, #13 in the following dotuments.

HOOlS OF THE CITt OF ANN ARBOR

By: -, ~Qxl---

Its: Robert Allen, Deputy Superin endent for Operations

Brief Description of Bid Item/s and Specifications:

Noon Hour SupeNision for Ann Arbor Public Schools



***************************************************************FOR BID0 ER USEONLy************************************ ***********************

NOTICE: Bidders are requested to answer the RFQ with either a
BID or a "NO BID".

TERMS: PROMPT PAYMENT DISCOUNTS ARE ENCOURAGED.
_% discount if payment is made within __ days after delivery
and receipt of correct invoicing.
( ) Yes () No If your company is awarded all or part of this bid, will
you extend these bid prices on the same terms and conditions to
other units of government within Washtenaw County?

Signature

Name (print or type)

Company or Corporation

Telephone Number

Title

Date



Ann Arbor Public Schools 2012 - 2015 Parking Event Space Rental - Specification 

 

 

Noon Hour Supervision For Ann Arbor Public Schools 

 
 

QUOTATION FORM 

 

 

 

 

The bidder hereby agrees and certifies to comply with all requirements within this specification and further agrees to 

accept in payment a dollar amount calculated from the quotation prices listed below for all work regarding this bid. 

 

The undersigned hereby authorizes any person, firm or corporation listed to furnish any information requested by the 

Owner in verification of the information submitted in this bid proposal package. 

 

Company:  

 

_____________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 Name 

 

_____________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 Address  City/State/Zip       Phone/Fax    e-mail 

 

 

Authorized By:  

 

_____________________________________________________________________________________________ 

Name         Title 

 

 

Signature        Date 

 

The Ann Arbor Public Schools reserves the right to award contracts to other bidders in succession on the bid list in 

the event the selected bidder cannot meet District schedules. 

 

 

Total Bid Amount: __________________________________________ 
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Washtenaw Area Schools Consortium
1 Efrlployment Application

Openings as of 8/7/2012

Noon Hour Supervisor

Position Type:
Hourly

Date Posted:
2/10/2011

Location:
Multiple Locations Available

POSITION TITLE:
FTE:
POSITION LOCATION:
REPORTING RELATIONSHIP:
Coordinator/Building Principal

JoblD: 345

Closing Date:
open until filled

Noon Hour Supervisor
Hourly $8.6(~ $10.15

Various Elementary Schools
On site Noon Hour

QUALIFICATION REQUIREMENTS: To perform this job
successfully, an individual must
be able to perform each essential duty satisfactorily. The
requirements listed below are
representative of the knowledge, skill, and/or ability required.
Reasonable accommodations
may be made to enable individuals with disabilities to perform the
essential functions.

EDUCATION and/or EXPERIENCE:
High School diploma or GED.

JOB RESPONSIBILITIES:
Supervise students at playtime and lunchtime and maintain a
harmonious atmosphere
by encouraging peaceful resolution of conflicts.
Organize group games and activities.
Assume responsibility for play equipment.
Direct movement of groups to and from playground, lunchroom aqd
classrooms in a safe
and organized manner.
Assist students in lunch room clean-up.
Other duties may be assigned.
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SUPERVISORY RESPONSIBILITIES:
The employee supervises students during the lunch program and is
directly responsible for
their safety and well-being.

LANGUAGE SKILLS:
Ability to read and comprehend simple instructions, short
correspondence, and memos.
Ability to write simple correspondence. Ability to effectively present
information in one-on
one and small group situations to staff.

MATHEMATICAL SKILLS:
Ability to add and subtract two digit numbers and to multiply and divide
with 1D's and 100's.
Ability to perform these operations using units of American money and
weight
measurement, volume and distance.

REASONING ABILITY:
Ability to apply common sense understanding to carry out instructions
furnished in written,
oral, or diagram form. Ability to deal with problems involving several
concrete variables in
standardized situations.

PHYSICAL DEMANDS: The physical demands described here are representative
of those that must be met by an employee to successfully perform the essential
functions of this job. Reasonable accommodations may be made to enable individuals
with disabilities to perform the essential functions. While performing the duties of this
job, the employee is regularly required to stand, talk, hear, walk, sit and run.
Frequently the employee will bend or twist more than the average person While
performing the duties of this job, the employee will be required to work out-ofJdoors
during all months of the school year. The employee is directly responsible for the
safety, well-being, or work output of other people. Specific vision abilities reqj1ired by
this job include near and far vision and the ability to adjust focus. The position requires
the individual to meet multiple demands from several people and interact with students
and other staff.

WORK ENVIRONMENT: The work environment characteristics
described here are representative of those an employee encounters
while performing the essential functions of this job. Reasonable
accommodations may be made to enable individuals with disabilities to
perform the essential functions. The noise level in the work
environment is occasionally moderate to loud. The employee is



frequently required to interact with the public and other staff. The
employee is directly responsible for the safety, well-being of students.

Application Procedure:
Must apply online at www.aaps.k12.mi.us. "Employment"

FMLA regulations require all employers to post the updated FMLA
notice.

Powered by AppliTrack, a product of Aspex Solutions.
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Current Personnel Cost for Noon Hour Supervision
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Avg Hrs
Emp# Loc Account Amount Rate FICA MED RET per day

115655 302 01.219.1664.302.· 456.90 10.15 28.33 6.63 111.76 0.248619
114004 302 01.219.1664.302.- 3.002.95 11.67 186.18 43.54 734.52 1.421271
114074 302 01.219.1664.302.- 652.35 10.15 40.45 9.46 159.56 0.354972
114936 302 01.219.1664.302.. 1.666.63 10.98 103.33 24.17 407.66 0.838398
112971 302 01.219.1664.302.- 2,171.22 11.67 134.62 31.48 531.08 1.027624
115656 302 01.219.1664.302.- 197.99 10.15 12.28 2.87 48.43 0.107735
115427 302 01.219.1664.302.- 2,258.97 9.37 140.06 32.76 552.54 1.331492
114741 302 01.219.1664.302.- 2,222.22 10.92 137.78 32.22 543.56 1.124309
114620 302 01.219.1664.302.- 2,020.68 10.92 125.28 29.30 494.26 1.022099

14,649.91 96.01 908.29 212.42 3,583.37

115421 309 01.219.1664.309.- 3,346.99 10.15 207.51 48.53 818.67 1.821823
109421 309 01.219.1664.309.· 3,341.91 10.15 207.20 48.46 817.43 1.819061
110732 309 01.219.1664.309.· 4,078.69 11.67 252.88 59.14 997.65 1.930939
115541 309 01.219.1664.309.· 1,283.98 10.15 79.61 18.62 314.06 0.698895
108490 309 01.219.1664.309.· 3,994.08 11.67 247.63 57.91 976.95 1.890884
102651 309 01.219.1664.309.· 4,849.80 14.16 300.69 70.32 1.186.26 1.892265
114544 309 01.219.1664.309.· 449.29 11.67 27.86 6.51 109.90 0.212707
107999 309 01.219.1664.309.· 3,991.16 11.67 247.45 57.87 976.24 1.889503
111992 309 01.219.1664.309.· 3,979.49 11.67 246.73 57.70 973.38 1.883978

29,315.39 102.96 1,817.55 425.07 7,170.54

113369 311 01.219.1664.311.· 3,953.23 11.67 245.10 57.32 966.96 1.871547
107830 311 01.219.1664.311.- 3.877.37 11.67 240.40 56.22 948.40 1.835635
105144 311 01.219.1664.311.- 1,365.18 10.15 84.64 19.80 333.92 0.743094
114641 311 01.219.1664.311.- 1.269.45 10.92 78.71 18.41 310.51 0.642265
115420 311 01.219.1664.311.- 2,991.73 10.15 185.49 43.38 731.78 1.628453
111491 311 01.219.1664.311.· 1,129.08 11.67 70.00 16.37 276.17 0.53453
115032 311 01.219.1664.311.· 1,222.79 9.37 75.81 17.73 299.09 0.720994
104504 311 01.219.1664.311.· 1,878.24 10.92 116.45 27.23 459.42 0.950276
113524 311 01.219.1664.311.· 3,620.64 11.67 224.48 52.50 885.61 1.714088
105843 311 01.219.1664.311.· 6,456.96 14.16 400.33 93.63 1,579.37 2.519337

27,764.67 112.35 1,721.41 402.59 6,791.24

110521 315 01.219.1664.315.1 23.34 11.67 1.45 0.34 5.71 0.01105
113401 315 01.219.1664.315.- 3,139.26 11.67 194.63 45.52 767.86 1.486188
110521 315 01.219.1664.315.- 3,075.07 11.67 190.65 44.59 752.16 1.455801
115199 315 01.219.1664.315.- 3,443.49 9.37 213.50 49.93 842.28 2.030387
104891 315 01.219.1664.315.- 3.428.27 10.15 212.55 49.71 838.55 1.866022
105837 315 01.219.1664.315.- 2,407.20 14.16 149.25 34.90 588.80 0.939227
113700 315 01.219.1664.315.- 948.20 11.67 58.79 13.75 231.93 0.448895
113700 315 01.219.1664.315.- 3,484.79 12.58 216.06 50.53 852.38 1.530387
115178 315 01.219.1664.315.· 3,676.83 10.15 227.96 53.31 899.35 2.001381
107574 315 01.219.1664.315.- 1,943.05 11.67 120.47 28.17 475.27 0.91989
111491 315 01.219.1664.315.· 2,751.22 11.67 170.58 39.89 672.95 1.302486
111567 315 01.219.1664.315.· 4,265.41 11.67 264.46 61.85 1,043.32 2.019337
101050 315 01.219.1664.315.· 1,910.97 11.67 118.48 27.71 467.42 0.904696

34.497.10 149.77 2,138.82 500.21 8,437.99

110606 317 01.219.1664.317.- 3,235.88 11.67 200.62 46.92 791.50 1.531768

110606 317 01.219.1664.317.· 63.72 14.16 3.95 0.92 15.59 0.024862

110595 317 01.219.1664.317.· 2,532.61 11.67 157.02 36.72 619.48 1.198895

100633 317 01.219.1664.317.· 3,571.45 11.67 22'..43 51.79 873.58 1.690608

114916 317 01.219.1664.317.· 2.571.66 10.92 1:9.44 37.29 629.03 1.301105

103918 317 01.219.1664.317.- 5,904.72 14.16 256.09 85.62 1,444.29 2.303867

114238 317 01.219.1664.317.- 2,345.00 10.15 145.39 34.00 573.59 1.276243

107188 317 01.219.1664.317.- 3,151.21 11.67 195.38 45.69 770.79 1.491713

108032 317 01.219.1664.317.- 3,232.99 11.67 200.45 46.88 790.79 1.530387

101666 317 01.219.1664.317.- 3,054.99 11.67 189.41 44.30 747.25 1.446133

108630 317 01.219.1664.317.- 3,072.45 11.67 19J.49 44.55 751.52 1.45442

115171 317 01.219.1664.317.- 2,684.98 10.15 166.47 38.93 656.75 1.461326
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112844 317 01.219.1664.317.- 1,476.98 10.15 91.57 21.42 361.27 0.803867
111909 317 01.219.1664.317.- 35.02 11.67 2.17 0.51 8.57 0.016575
102146 317 01.219.1664.317.- 2,439.05 11.67 151.22 35.37 596.59 1.154696

39,372.71 174.74 2,441.11 570.90 9,630.56

114113 319 01.219.1664.319.- 2,544.78 11.67 157.78 36.90 622.45 1.20442
114916 319 01.219.1664.319.- 382.20 10.92 23.70 5.54 93.49 0.19337
102350 319 01.219.1664.319.- 2,462.46 10.92 152.67 35.71 602.32 1.245856'
108867 319 01.219.1664.319.· 2,007.24 11.67 124.45 29.10 490.97 0.950276
102382 319 01.219.1664.319.- 210.90 9.37 13.08 3.06 51.59 0.124309
114087 319 01.219.1664.319.- 1,157.48 10.15 71.76 16.78 283.12 0.629834
106479 319 01.219.1664.319.- 1,578.81 11.67 97.89 22.89 386.18 0.747238,
113575 319 01.219.1664.319.- 4,321.23 12.58 267.92 62.66 1,056.97 1.89779
103314 319 01.219.1664.319.· 2,658.58 11.67 164.83 38.55 650.29 1.258287

17,323.68 100.64 1,074.07 251.19 4,237.37

111981 328 01.219.1664.328.- 3,833.62 11.67 237.68 55.59 937.70 1.814917
115145 328 01.219.1664.328.· 3.295.91 9.37 204.35 47.79 806.18 1.94337
114312 328 01.219.1664.328.- 1,823.64 10.92 113.07 26.44 446.06 0.922652
114151 328 01.219.1664.328.- 227.84 10.98 14.13 3.30 55.73 0.114641
114151 328 01.219.1664.328.- 3,650.01 10.92 226.30 52.93 892.79 1.846685
102572 328 01.219.1664.328.- 4,810.86 14.16 298.27 69.76 1,176.74 1.877072
103472 328 01.219.1664.328.- 627.26 11.67 38.89 9.10 153.43 0.296961
103331 328 01.219.1664.328.- 175.05 11.67 10.85 2.54 42.82 0.082873
107871 328 01.219.1664.328.- 4,169.12 11.67 258.49 60.45 1,019.77 1.973757

22,613.31 103.03 1,402.03 327.89 5,531.22

115472 332 01.219.1664.332.· 2,098.52 10.15 130.11 30.43 513.30 1.142265
114340 332 01.219.1664.332.· 3,420.55 10.15 212.07 49.60 836.67 1.861878
102287 332 01.219.1664.332.· 2,844.66 10.92 176.37 41.25 695.80 1.439227
108871 332 01.219.1664.332.- 106.20 14.16 6.58 1.54 25.98 0.041436
108871 332 01.219.1664.332.· 3,926.96 11.67 243.47 56.94 960.53 1.859116
104841 332 01.219.1664.332.- 3,696.90 13.37 229.21 53.61 904.26 1.527624
104841 332 01.219.1664.332.- 2,159.40 14.16 133.88 31.31 528.19 0.842541
107431 332 01.219.1664.332.- 714.24 11.67 44.28 10.36 174.70 0.338122
102382 332 01.219.1664.332.· 56.22 9.37 3.49 0.82 13.75 0.033149
107177 332 01.219.1664.332.· 4,087.42 11.67 253.42 59.27 999.78 1.935083
112691 332 01.219.1664.332.· 4,034.91 11.67 250.16 58.51 986.94 1.910221
114334 332 01.219.1664.332.· 3,687.72 11.67 228.64 53.47 902.02 1.745856
114566 332 01.219.1664.332.· 3,813.18 11.67 236.42 55.29 932.70 1.805249
109212 332 01.219.1664.332.- 3,807.34 11.67 236.06 55.21 931.28 1.802486

38,454.22 163.97 2,384.16 557.59 9,405.90

115592 335 01.219.1664.335.- 1,408.32 10.15 87.32 20.42 344.48 0.766575
102617 335 01.219.1664.335.- 141.60 14.16 8.78 2.05 34.64 0.055249
102617 335 01.219.1664.335.- 1,712.60 11.67 106.18 24.83 418.90 0.810773
100389 335 01.219.1664.335.· 3,606.06 11.67 223.58 52.29 882.04 1.707182
110649 335 01.219.1664.335.· 5,717.10 14.16 354.46 82.90 1,398.40 2.230663

115050 335 01.219.1664.335.· 3,537.31 10.15 219.31 51.29 865.23 1.925414
102084 335 01.219.1664.335.· 1,671.76 11.67 103.65 24.24 408.91 0.791436
111879 335 01.219.1664.335.- 4,090.38 11.67 253.60 59.31 1,000.51 1.936464

113691 335 01.219.1664.335.· 1,032.00 8.60 63.98 14.96 252.43 0.662983
114093 335 01.219.1664.335.· 4,212.90 11.67 261.20 61.09 1,030.48 1.994475
115599 335 01.219.1664.335.- 770.69 9.37 47.78 11.18 188.51 0.45442

27,900.72 124.94 1,729.84 404.56 6,824.52

115045 336 01.219.1664.336.- 1,657.11 10.92 102.74 24.03 405.33 0.838398

115045 336 01.219.1664.336.- 1,738.14 14.16 107.76 25.20 425.15 0.678177

113587 336 01.219.1664.336.· 71.04 10.15 4.40 1.03 17.38 0.038674

102854 336 01.219.1664.336.- 20.42 11.67 1.27 0.30 4.99 0.009669

115451 336 01.219.1664.336.· 2,330.98 9.37 144.52 33.80 570.16 1.374309
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115136 336 01.219.1664.336.· 3,202.62 10.15 198.56 46.44 783.36 1.74337
113204 336 01.219.1664.336.· 2,852.90 9.37 176.88 41.37 697.82 1.682044
115175 336 01.219.1664.336.· 2,997.54 10.92 185.85 43.46 733.20 1.516575
112727 336 01.219.1664.336.· 2,564.35 11.67 158.99 37.18 627.24 1.214088
108846 336 01.219.1664.336.- 3,106.96 11.67 192.63 45.05 759.96 1.470994
115359 336 01.219.1664.336.· 2,786.04 10.15 172.73 40.40 681.47 1.516575
112309 336 01.219.1664.336.- 4,600.62 11.67 285.24 66.71 1,125.31 2.178177
100340 336 01.219.1664.336.· 1,283.88 10.15 79.60 18.62 314.04 0.698895
102341 336 01.219.1664.336.· 2,573.58 14.16 159.56 37.32 629.50 1.004144

31,786.18 156.17 1,970.74 460.90 7,774.90

115417 341 01.219.1664.341.' 2,111.16 10.15 130.89 30.61 516.39 1.149171
103318 341 01.219.1664.341.· 3,416.35 11.67 211.81 49.54 835.64 1.617403
103167 341 01.219.1664.341.- 24.78 14.16 1.54 0.36 6.06 0.009669
103167 341 01.219.1664.341.- 3,395.92 11.67 210.55 49.24 830.64 1.607735
113411 341 01.219.1664.341.- 2,844.54 11.67 176.36 41.25 695.77 1.346685
114268 341 01.219.1664.341.- 3,306.03 10.92 204.97 47.94 808.65 1.672652
114295 341 01.219.1664.341.- 3,267.81 10.92 202.60 47.38 799.31 1.653315
115527 341 01.219.1664.341.· 1,621.48 9.37 100.53 23.51 396.61 0.956077
110654 341 01.219.1664.341.· 5,632.14 14.16 349.19 81.67 1,377.62 2.197514
115077 341 01.219.1664.341.· 1,659.62 11.77 102.90 24.06 405.94 0.779006
115077 341 01.219.1664.341.· 1,528.80 10.92 94.79 22.17 373.94 0.773481
115081 341 01.219.1664.341.- 3,004.35 10.15 186.27 43.56 734.86 1.635359
104547 341 01.219.1664.341.· 714.78 11.67 44.32 10.36 174.84 0.338398
101935 341 01.219.1664.341.· 2,281.51 11.67 141.45 33.08 558.06 1.08011

34,809.27 160.87 2,158.17 504.73 8,514.35

113415 342 01.219.1664.342.· 1,569.62 11.67 97.32 22.76 383.93 0.743094
115117 342 01.219.1664.342.- 2,504.52 10.15 155.28 36.32 612.61 1.36326
114242 342 01.219.1664.342.· 4,052.43 11.67 251.25 58.76 991.22 1.918508
105961 342 01.219.1664.342.- 5,724.18 14.16 354.90 83.00 1,400.13 2.233425
115484 342 01.219.1664.342.- 2,326.91 10.15 144.27 33.74 569.16 1.266575
114908 342 01.219.1664.342.- 2,304.12 10.92 142.86 33.41 563.59 1.165746
112766 342 01.219.1664.342.- 3,439.74 11.67 213.26 49.88 841.36 1.628453
115496 342 01.219.1664.342.· 2,457.29 9.37 152.35 35.63 601.05 1.448895
115422 342 01.219.1664.342.· 3,120.22 9.37 193.45 45.24 763.21 1.839779

113945 342 01.219.1664.342.· 1,515.15 10.92 93.94 21.97 370.61 0.766575
29,014.18 110.05 1,798.88 420.71 7,096.87

103170 343 01.219.1664.343.· 5,055.12 14.16 313.42 73.30 1,236.48 1.972376

110621 343 01.219.1664.343.- 3,658.55 11.67 226.83 53.05 894.88 1.732044

114165 343 01.219.1664.343.- 2,625.78 11.67 162.80 38.07 642.27 1.243094

114062 343 01.219.1664.343.· 3,810.29 11.67 236.24 55.25 932.00 1.803867

105868 343 01.219.1664.343.· 5,055.12 14.16 313.42 73.30 1,236.48 1.972376

114059 343 01.219.1664.343.- 3,238.43 11.67 200.78 46.96 792.12 1.533149

104022 343 01.219.1664.343.· 3,985.31 11.67 247.09 57.79 974.81 1.88674

105942 343 01.219.1664.343.· 3,267.60 11.67 202.59 47.38 799.25 1.546961

114440 343 01.219.1664.343.· 3,226.86 10.92 200.07 46.79 789.29 1.632597

33,923.06 109.26 2,103.23 491.88 8,297.58

115516 346 01.219.1664.346.- 1,642.65 9.37 101.84 23.82 401.79 0.968232

113501 346 01.219.1664.346.- 2,848.20 11.67 176.59 41.30 696.67 1.348066

113582 346 01.219.1664.346.- 3,122.56 11.67 193.60 45.28 763.78 1.477901

104542 346 01.219.1664.346.· 2,912.47 11.67 180.57 42.23 712.39 1.378453

112106 346 01.219.1664.346.· 4,545.36 14.16 281.81 65.91 1,111.80 1.773481

114543 346 01.219.1664.346.· 327.60 10.92 20.31 4.75 80.13 0.165746

115429 346 01.219.1664.346.· 2,298.68 10.15 142.52 33.33 562.26 1.250829

114036 346 01.219.1664.346.- 644.28 10.92 39.95 9.34 157.59 0.325967

18,341.80 90.55 1,137.19 265.96 4,486.40

108813 347 01.219.1664.347.. 5,954.28 14.16 369.17 86.34 1,456.42 2.323204
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100890 347 01.219.1664.347.- 1,975.17 11.67 122.46 28.64 483.13 0.935083
113386 347 01.219.1664.347.- 3,976.56 11.67 246.55 57.66 972.67 1.882597
113381 347 01.219.1664.347.- 4,023.24 11.67 249.44 58.34 984.08 1.904696
115091 347 01.219.1664.347.- 3,442.53 10.92 213.44 49.92 842.04 1.741713
110605 347 01.219.1664.347.- 3,836.52 11.67 237.86 55.63 938.41 1.816298
115566 347 01.219.1664.347.- 989.71 10.15 61.36 14.35 242.08 0.538674

24,198.01 81.91 1,500.28 350.87 5,918.83

115103 353 01.219.1664.353.- 2,953.94 9.37 183.14 42.83 722.53 1.741713
115568 353 01.219.1664.353.- 18.74 9.37 1.16 0.27 4.58 0.01105
109428 353 01.219.1664.353.- 4,892.28 14.16 303.32 70.94 1,196.65 1.90884
109412 353 01.219.1664.353.- 3,573.57 10.92 221.56 51.82 874.10 1.808011
108789 353 01.219.1664.353.- 4,580.51 11.67 283.99 66.42 1,120.39 2.168508
108789 353 01.219.1664.353.- 1,550.52 14.16 96.13 22.48 379.26 0.604972
114913 353 01.219.1664.353.- 489.74 10.15 30.36 7.10 119.79 0.266575
115577 353 01.219.1664.353.- 1,423.56 10.15 88.26 20.64 348.20 0.774862
108362 353 01.219.1664.353.- 5,473.28 11.67 339.34 79.36 1,338.76 2.59116
115475 353 01.219.1664.353.- 2,283.97 9.37 141.61 33.12 558.66 1.346685
102382 353 01.219.1664.353.- 100.73 9.37 6.25 1.46 24.64 0.059392
103487 353 01.219.1664.353.- 3,766.64 11.67 233.53 54.62 921.32 1.783149
114319 353 01.219.1664.353.- 806.95 10.15 50.03 11.70 197.38 0.439227
111952 353 01.219.1664.353.- 1,768.03 11.67 109.62 25.64 432.46 0.837017
114265 353 01.219.1664.353.- 2,930.86 10.15 181.71 42.50 716.89 1.595304

36,613.32 164.00 2,270.03 530.89 8,955.62

115446 359 01.219.1664.359.- 3,182.04 10.15 197.29 46.14 778.33 1.732044
113483 359 01.219.1664.359.- 2,118.13 11.67 131.32 30.71 518.09 1.002762
113483 359 01.219.1664.359.- 1,430.08 11.77 88.66 20.74 349.80 0.671271
113037 359 01.219.1664.359.- 547.31 11.77 33.93 7.94 133.87 0.256906
113037 359 01.219.1664.359.- 2,806.84 11.67 174.02 40.70 686.55 1.328729
113545 359 01.219.1664.359.- 456.09 11.77 28.28 6.61 111.56 0.214088
113545 359 01.219.1664.359.- 3,393.06 11.67 210.37 49.20 829.94 1.606354
104780 359 01.219.1664.359.- 424.80 14.16 26.34 6.16 103.91 0.165746
104780 359 01.219.1664.359.- 560.17 11.67 34.73 8.12 137.02 0.265193
115032 359 01.219.1664.359.- 1,583.55 9.37 98.18 22.96 387.34 0.933702
114034 359 01.219.1664.359.- 3,775.26 11.67 234.07 54.74 923.43 1.787293
109261 359 01.219.1664.359.- 1,915.14 14.16 118.74 27.77 468.44 0.747238
115581 359 01.219.1664.359.- 162.40 10.15 10.07 2.35 39.72 0.088398
115446 359 02.125.1894.359.: 101.50 10.15 6.29 1.47 24.83 0.055249
113483 359 02.125.1894.359.: 116.70 11.67 7.24 1.69 28.54 0.055249
113037 359 02.125.1894.359.: 116.70 11.67 7.24 1.69 28.54 0.055249
113545 359 02.125.1894.359.: 93.36 11.67 5.79 1.35 22.84 0.044199
114034 359 02.125.1894.359.: 116.70 11.67 7.24 1.69 28.54 0.055249

109261 359 02.125.1894.359.: 148.68 14.16 9.22 2.16 36.37 0.058011
23,048.51 222.64 1,429.01 334.20 5,637.67

115103 360 01.219.1664.360.- 260.02 9.37 16.12 3.77 63.60 0.153315
105399 360 01.219.1664.360.- 2,497.47 11.67 154.84 36.21 610.88 1.18232
110576 360 01.219.1664.360.- 2,030.58 11.67 125.90 29.44 496.68 0.961326

115571 360 01.219.1664.360.- 1,567.14 9.37 97.16 22.72 383.32 0.924033
101070 360 01.219.1664.360.- 4,453.27 11.67 276.10 64.57 1,089.27 2.108287

101070 360 01.219.1664.360.- 723.35 12.58 44.85 10.49 176.93 0.31768

115495 360 01.219.1664.360.- 629.30 10.15 39.02 9.12 153.93 0.342541

107652 360 01.219.1664.360.- 621.43 11.67 38.53 9.01 152.00 0.294199

102361 360 01.219.1664.360.- 653.52 11.67 40.52 9.48 159.85 0.309392

115086 360 01.219.1664.360.- 1,948.80 10.15 120.83 28.26 476.68 1.060773

101666 360 01.219.1664.360.- 140.04 11.67 8.68 2.03 34.25 0.066298

115432 360 01.219.1664.360.- 1,481.90 10.15 91.88 21.49 362.47 0.80663

115435 360 01.219.1664.360.- 1,289.06 10.15 79.92 18.69 315.30 0.701657

115512 360 01.219.1664.360.- 2,049.39 10.15 127.06 29.72 501.28 1.115525

106479 360 01.219.1664.360.- 177.97 16.18 11.03 2.58 43.53 0.060773
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106479 360 01.219.1664.360.· 402.62 11.67 24.96 5.84 98.48 0.190608
113963 360 01.219.1664.360.- 223.30 10.15 13.84 3.24 54.62 0.121547
113963 360 01.219.1664.360.- 3,464.85 10.98 214.82 50.24 847.50 1.743923
102146 360 01.219.1664.360.- 93.36 11.67 5.79 1.35 22.84 0.044199
102445 360 01.219.1664.360.- 2,276.65 10.15 141.15 33.01 556.87 1.239227
115509 360 01.219.1664.360.- 2,281.60 9.37 141.46 33.08 558.08 1.345304
101070 360 02.125.1294.360.: 834.41 11.67 51.73 12.10 204.10 0.395028

30,100.03 243.93 1,866.20 436.45 7,362.47

112058 366 01.219.1664.366.· 3,746.65 11.67 232.29 54.33 916.43 1.773757
110632 366 01.219.1664.366.· 2,843.09 12.58 176.27 41.22 695.42 1.248619
114040 366 01.219.1664.366.· 595.17 11.67 36.90 8.63 145.58 0.281768
115467 366 01.219.1664.366.· 2,085.50 8.60 129.30 30.24 510.11 1.339779
114058 366 01.219.1664.366.- 3,994.07 11.67 247.63 57.91 976.95 1.890884
115460 366 01.219.1664.366.· 2,225.92 9.37 138.01 32.28 544.46 1.312431
112862 366 01.219.1664.366.· 4,177.87 11.67 259.03 60.58 1,021.91 1.977901
115229 366 01.219.1664.366.- 3.717.45 10.15 230.48 53.90 909.29 2.023481
115424 366 01.219.1664.366.· 3,603.27 10.15 223.40 52.25 881.36 1.961326
113530 366 01.219.1664.366.- 2,928.62 11.67 181.57 42.46 716.34 1.386464
106827 366 01.219.1664.366.- 3,477.67 11.67 215.62 50.43 850.64 1.646409
110632 366 01.219.1894.366.1 12.58 12.58 0.78 0.18 3.08 0.005525

33,407.86 133.45 2,071.29 484.41 8,171.56

112404 368 01.219.1664.368.· 1,998.81 11.67 123.93 28.98 488.91 0.946133
105344 368 01.219.1664.368.· 1,861.36 11.67 115.40 26.99 455.29 0.881215
115463 368 01.219.1664.368.· 1,063.55 9.37 65.94 15.42 260.14 0.627072
114985 368 01.219.1664.368.· 578.76 10.92 35.88 8.39 141.56 0.292818
112071 368 01.219.1664.368.· 2,708.05 11.67 167.90 39.27 662.39 1.281768
113482 368 01.219.1664.368.- 793.64 11.67 49.21 11.51 194.12 0.375691

100654 368 01.219.1664.368.- 4,952.46 14.16 307.05 71.81 1,211.37 1.93232

111894 368 01.219.1664.368.- 3,579.35 11.67 221.92 51.90 875.51 1.694751
100691 368 01.219.1664.368.- 3,043.81 11.67 188.72 44.14 744.52 1.440608
109219 368 01.219.1664.368.- 2,599.19 11.67 161.15 37.69 635.76 1.230663
114547 368 01.219.1664.368.· 1,711.71 10.92 106.13 24.82 418.68 0.866022

108563 368 01.219.1664.368.· 1,546.47 11.67 95.88 22.42 378.27 0.732044

26,437.16 138.74 1,639.10 383.34 6,466.53

101543 398 01.219.1664.398.- 3,110.34 11.67 192.84 45.10 760.79 1.472376

101869 398 01.219.1664.398.· 3,439.99 11.67 213.28 49.88 841.42 1.628453

112230 398 01.219.1664.398.· 8,680.42 12.58 538.19 125.87 2,123.23 3.812155

113587 398 01.219.1664.398.- 50.75 10.15 3.15 0.74 12.41 0.027624

115005 398 01.219.1664.398.- 4,226.04 10.92 262.01 61.28 1,033.69 2.138122

108221 398 01.219.1664.398.- 4,499.03 11.67 278.94 65.24 1,100.46 2.129834

102934 398 01.219.1664.398.- 2,981.80 11.67 184.87 43.24 729.35 1.411602

102906 398 01.219.1664.398.· 4,749.94 11.67 294.50 68.87 1,161.84 2.248619

112841 398 01.219.1664.398.· 3,892.76 10.15 241.35 56.45 952.17 2.118785

110664 398 01.219.1664.398.- 2,654.99 11.67 164.61 38.50 649.41 1.256906

112037 398 01.219.1664.398.- 3,504.10 11.67 217.25 50.81 857.10 1.65884

106479 398 01.219.1664.398.· 177.97 41.88 11.03 2.58 43.53 0.023481

106479 398 01.219.1664.398.· 306.36 11.67 18.99 4.44 74.94 0.145028

106479 398 01.219.1664.398.· 177.98 11.67 11.03 2.58 43.53 0.084254

103239 398 01.219.1664.398.· 4,183.94 11.67 259.40 60.67 1,023.39 1.980663

46,636.41 202.38 2,891.46 676.23 11,407.27

115650 769 01.219.1664.769.- 888.30 10.15 55.07 12.88 217.28 0.483425

108314 769 01.219.1664.769.- 3,770.05 11.67 233.74 54.67 922.15 1.78453

115455 769 01.219.1664.769.- 3,715.63 10.15 230.37 53.88 908.84 2.022099

115495 769 01.219.1664.769.- 1,654.77 10.15 102.60 23.99 404.76 0.900552

114153 769 01.219.1664.769.- 2,582.58 10.92 160.12 37.45 631.70 1.30663

115652 769 01.219.1664.769.- 913.68 10.15 56.65 13.25 223.49 0.497238

114046 769 01.219.1664.769.· 87.54 11.67 5.43 1.27 21.41 0.041436



Current Personnel Cost for Noon Hour Supervision
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Avg Hrs
Emp# Loc Account Amount Rate FICA MED RET per day

111762 769 01.219.1664.769.- 1,698.06 10.92 105.28 24.62 415.35 0.859116
15,310.61 85.79 949.26 222.00 3,744.98

102343 770 01.112.1894.770.1 3,243.70 13.13 201.11 47.03 793.41 1.364641
111774 770 01.112.1894.770.1 24.57 10.92 1.52 0.36 6.01 0.012431
105309 770 01.112.1894.770.1 24.57 10.92 1.52 0.36 6.01 0.012431
101870 770 01.112.1894.770.1 24.57 10.92 1.52 0.36 6.01 0.012431
115558 770 01.112.1894.770.1 524.16 10.92 32.50 7.60 128.21 0.265193
114912 770 01.112.1894.770.1 210.87 9.37 13.07 3.06 51.58 0.124309
102875 770 01.219.1664.770.· 4,412.01 11.67 273.54 63.97 1,079.18 2.088398
102343 770 01.219.1664.770.· 226.59 10.92 14.05 3.29 55.42 0.114641
114913 770 01.219.1664.770.- 3,223.26 10.15 199.84 46.74 788.41 1.754144
107431 770 01.219.1664.770.- 2,538.67 11.67 157.40 36.81 620.96 1.201657
100193 770 01.219.1664.770.· 4,715.48 11.67 292.36 68.37 1,153.41 2.232044
101870 770 01.219.1664.770.- 49.14 10.92 3.05 0.71 12.02 0.024862
114912 770 01.219.1664.770.- 3,491.07 9.37 216.45 50.62 853.92 2.058011

22,708.66 142.56 1,407.94 329.28 5,554.54

115469 771 01.219.1664.771.- 355.25 10.15 22.03 5.15 86.89 0.19337
115506 771 01.219.1664.771.· 2,649.19 10.15 164.25 38.41 647.99 1.441989
109737 771 01.219.1664.771.- 5,610.04 11.67 347.82 81.35 1,372.22 2.655801
115222 771 01.219.1664.771.- 5,034.61 10.15 312.15 73.00 1,231.47 2.740331
113371 771 01.219.1664.771.- 5,736.00 11.67 355.63 83.17 1,403.03 2.71547
109736 771 01.219.1664.771.- 5,747.66 11.67 356.35 83.34 1,405.88 2.720994
109736 771 02.125.1244.771.: 262.58 11.67 16.28 3.81 64.23 0.124309

25,395.33 77.13 1,574.51 368.23 6,211.70

105299 772 01.219.1664.772.- 6,337.58 11.67 392.93 91.89 1,550.17 3
113845 772 01.219.1664.772.· 3,945.13 11.67 244.60 57.20 964.98 1.867403
115444 772 01.219.1664.772.- 2,713.19 9.37 168.22 39.34 663.65 1.599448
114015 772 01.219.1664.772.· 1,747.20 10.92 108.33 25.33 427.37 0.883978
115444 772 01.222.1634.772.1 117.15 9.37 7.26 1.70 28.65 0.069061

14,860.25 53.01 921.34 215.47 3,634.82

103146 774 01.219.1664.774.- 5,356.89 11.67 332.13 77.67 1,310.30 2.535912

113418 774 01.219.1664.774.- 4,487.87 11.67 278.25 65.07 1,097.73 2.124309

110638 774 01.219.1664.774.- 4,855.55 11.67 301.04 70.41 1,187.67 2.298343
110628 774 01.219.1664.774.- 5,181.92 11.67 321.28 75.14 1,267.50 2.453039

19,882.23 46.69 1,232.70 288.29 4,863.19

718,364.58 3,347.54 44,538.60 10,416.29 175,711.98
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ANN ARBOR PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

PURCHASE ORDER TERMS & CONDITIONS 
 

These Purchase Order Terms & Conditions (the “Terms & Conditions”) apply to 
all purchase orders issued by THE PUBLIC SCHOOLS OF THE CITY OF ANN ARBOR 
(“AAPS”).  

1. Purchase Order.  Any purchase order issued by AAPS shall be subject to these 
Terms and Conditions.  Vendor’s provision of goods or services to AAPS shall 
constitute acceptance to these Terms & Conditions.  No additional terms shall be made 
a part of these Terms & Conditions, or of any offer made by AAPS to Vendor, without 
the express written consent of AAPS. 

2. Warranty.  Vendor warrants all goods which it may sell to AAPS for a period of 
one (1) year against defects in design, materials, and workmanship.  The warranty 
period shall start at the later of the date of the completion of delivery or date of 
completion of installation, and during such warranty period all costs for parts and labor 
for repairs shall be borne by the Vendor.  

3. Preemption.  In the event of conflicting provisions among the purchase order, 
these Terms & Conditions, and Vendor’s proposal/quote, provisions from the following 
documents will control in the order listed herein: (a) the purchase order, (b) these Terms 
& Conditions, and (c) Vendor’s proposal/quote, with the purchase order superceding 
any conflicting terms in the other documents.  

4. Payment Terms.  Payment shall be made by AAPS within thirty (30) days of the 
latest of the date of the completion of delivery, the date of completion of installation, or 
the date of the receipt of an original invoice at P.O. Box 1188, Ann Arbor, Michigan 
48106. 

5. Delivery.  In the event a good or service to be supplied by Vendor is not delivered 
to the location and by the date specified, if any, on the AAPS purchase order relating to 
such good or service then such failure shall entitle AAPS to refuse acceptance of further 
deliveries of goods or to cancel its contract with Vendor in whole or in part.  All goods 
provided by Vendor must be delivered to AAPS between the working hours of 8:00 a.m. 
and 3:00 p.m. 

6. Compliance with Regulations.  Vendor shall comply with the following 
provisions: 

(a) Nondiscrimination.  Vendor, Vendor’s contractors and 
subcontractors may not discriminate against any employee or applicant for 
employment because of race, creed, color, gender, national origin, or age except 
where based on a bona fide occupational qualification.   

(b) Disclosure of Conflicts of Interest.  Vendor must disclose in 
writing whether, to its actual knowledge, any member of the AAPS Board of 
Education or any AAPS employee or member of the immediate family of the 
member of the AAPS Board of Education or the AAPS employee possesses a 
Financial Interest in Vendor or receives a benefit, bonus, commission, payment, 
consideration, or item of value from Vendor as a result of the transaction of 
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business with AAPS.  Such written disclosure must be submitted to AAPS by 
Vendor prior to the delivery of goods.  If such conflict of interest is discovered 
subsequent to the delivery of Vendor’s goods, written disclosure must be 
submitted to AAPS within seven (7) business days of discovery.  AAPS reserves 
the right to terminate any contract with a Vendor immediately upon the 
notification of a conflict of interest.  Upon such termination, AAPS shall 
compensate the Vendor only for the value of any goods or services provided to 
AAPS prior to such termination.  

(c) Definitions.  For purposes of these Terms & Conditions, the 
following definitions apply: 

(i) A “Financial Interest” shall be defined as a relationship 
wherein (1) an AAPS employee or a member of his or her immediate 
family is a partner, member, director, or officer of the Vendor, or (2) the 
AAPS employee or his or her family member owns not less than one 
percent (1%) of any class of stock in the Vendor or an amount of stock 
having a total market value in excess of $25,000.00. 

(ii) “Domestic Partner” shall be defined as provided in 
Chapter 110 of the City Code of the City of Ann Arbor, as the same may 
be amended from time to time. 

(iii) “Immediate family” shall be defined as a spouse, the in-
laws of a spouse, parent, the in-laws of a parent, child, the in-laws of a 
child, sibling, the in-laws of a sibling, grandparent, the in-laws of a 
grandparent, aunt, the in-laws of an aunt, uncle, the in-laws of an uncle, 
first cousin, the in-laws of a first cousin, the domestic partner, or any of 
the foregoing familial relations listed herein of the domestic partner of an 
AAPS employee. 

7. Purchase Order Requirements.  All purchase orders must be in writing, possess 
the signatures of the then current AAPS Director of Purchasing and Business Support 
Services and Finance Director, and be in the standard form from time to time used by 
AAPS (see attached Exhibit “A” for current example).  Oral purchase orders shall not 
be valid.  All purchase orders shall be delivered to AAPS at: P.O. Box 1188, Ann Arbor, 
Michigan 48106.  All purchase orders above the State of Michigan’s bid index amount 
must include a valid AAPS Board of Education annex number. 

8. AAPS as Offeror.  Any price quotes provided by Vendor for its goods/services 
shall be treated as for informational purposes only and not as an offer.  AAPS shall be 
treated as the offeror in all contracts between AAPS and Vendor. 

9. Invoices.  All original invoices sent by Vendor to AAPS must reference the 
identification number from the corresponding purchase order.  All of Vendor’s original 
invoices shall be sent to AAPS at:  P.O. Box 1188, Ann Arbor, Michigan 48106. 

10. Default by Vendor and AAPS Remedies.  In the event that Vendor defaults by 
failing, at any time, to comply with its obligations under the provisions of these Terms & 
Conditions or any other contract with AAPS, then AAPS reserves the right to 
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immediately terminate any and all contracts with Vendor in whole or in part.  Such right 
of termination is in addition to any other rights provided to AAPS under law or equity. 

11. Entire Agreement.  Each contract between AAPS and Vendor shall consist of (a) 
these Terms & Conditions, (b) the AAPS purchase order, and (c) any written price quote 
issued by Vendor.  Such documents constitute the entire contract between the parties 
with respect to the subject matter hereof. 

12. Assignment.  Vendor shall not have the right to assign or otherwise transfer its 
rights and obligations under any agreement with AAPS except with the prior written 
consent of AAPS.  Any prohibited assignment shall be null and void. 

13. Notices.  Notices permitted or required to be given hereunder shall be deemed 
sufficient if given by registered or certified mail, postage prepaid, return receipt 
requested, addressed to the respective addresses of the parties as first above written or 
at such other addresses as the respective parties may designate by like notice from time 
to time.  Unless specified otherwise herein in connection with any particular notice, 
notices so given shall be effective upon receipt by the party to which notice is given.   

14. Amendment.  These Terms & Conditions shall not be deemed or construed to be 
modified, amended, rescinded, canceled or waived, in whole or in part, except by 
written amendment signed by the parties hereto.  Any modification or amendment shall 
be effective only upon the issuance by AAPS of a revised purchase order and the 
conveyance of the same to the Vendor. 

15. Severability.  In the event that any of the terms of these Terms & Conditions are 
in conflict with any rules of law or statutory provision or are otherwise unenforceable 
under the laws or regulations of any government or subdivision thereof, such terms shall 
be deemed stricken from these Terms & Conditions. 

16. Governing Law.  These Terms & Conditions shall be governed under the laws of 
the State of Michigan.  

17. Dispute Resolution. Any and all disputes, controversies or claims arising out of 
or in connection with or relating to this Purchase Order, or any breach or alleged breach 
thereof, shall, at the request of either party, be submitted to and settled by arbitration in 
the State of Michigan pursuant to the rules, then in effect, of the American Arbitration 
Association (or at any other place or under any other form of arbitration mutually 
acceptable to the parties involved). The parties hereto specifically agree to arbitrate with 
the other party in a joint proceeding with regard to all common issues and disputes, and 
to permit pre-hearing discovery in the time and manner provided by the then applicable 
Michigan Court Rules. This Agreement to arbitrate shall be specifically enforceable under 
the prevailing arbitration law. Notice of the demand for arbitration shall be filed, in 
writing, with the other party to this Agreement and with the American Arbitration 
Association. The demand for arbitration shall be made within six (6) months after the 
claim, dispute, or other matter in question arose where the party asserting the claim 
should reasonably have been aware of the same. 

 



 8/3/2012 

 
 The arbitrator shall have no power to add to, subtract from, or alter the terms of 
this Agreement, and shall render a written decision setting forth findings and 
conclusions only as to the claims or disputes at issue. The expenses of any arbitration 
shall be borne equally by the parties to such arbitration, provided that each party shall 
pay for and bear the costs of its own experts, evidence and counsel’s fees. 
  
 Any award by the arbitrator shall be final and conclusive upon the parties, and a 
judgment thereon may be entered in the highest court for the forum, state or federal, 
having jurisdiction. 
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EXHIBIT “A” 

Vendor: [Vendor Number]          PURCHASE ORDER  P/O #: [PO Number] 
ANN ARBOR PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

FINANCE DEPARTMENT 

P.O. BOX 1188 

ANN ARBOR, MI 48106 
(000) 000-0000 

 
TO: [Vendor Name] SHIP TO: [AAPS LOCATION TO BE NAMED] 
 [Vendor Address] FED ID #00-0000000 TAX EXEMPT  
  _____________________________   
  ANN ARBOR, MI 4810__ 
 (734) ____-______ 
      ATTN: [AAPS Employee Name] 

 

Date: [Date] Required: [Date]  Include Shipping  Req: [Req. No.]  

--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
QUANTITY  DESCRIPTION DISCOUNT UNIT PRICE      TOTAL 

--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 

[No. of items]  [Item description] [Discount] [Unit price]   [Total price] 
 

 

 

          --------------------------- 
         TOTAL [Total price] 

     ****************** 

**    ** 
 

 

 

 
 

 

ACCOUNT         AMOUNT 
[Account Number]        [Total amount] 

 

 
 

 

 

[Signature]        [Signature]   

Finance Director       Purchasing Director 



 ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS 

REGARDING BIDS SUBMITTED TO 

THE PUBLIC SCHOOLS OF THE CITY OF ANN ARBOR 

1. Bids Received – Bids are considered received by the Public Schools of the City of 
Ann Arbor (“AAPS”) when they are date/time stamped by the Purchasing and 
Business Support Services Office or the department requesting the quotation(s). Bidders 
are responsible for making sure that bid proposals arrive at the specified location on or 
before the bid-opening deadline.  Facsimile bids shall not be accepted.  No bid received 
after the bid-opening deadline will be considered. 

2. Warranty – Specific warranty information on parts, material and labor must be 
included with any bid submitted by Bidder.  All equipment and supplies shall be 
warranted by the bidder for a period of at least one (1) year against defects in design, 
materials and workmanship.  The warranty period shall start on the later of the date of 
the completion of delivery or the date of completion of installation, and during such 
warranty period all costs for parts and labor for repairs shall be borne by the Bidder.  

3. Condition of Equipment – All equipment, supplies and materials shall be new and 
free from corrosion, scratches, or other such defects which present an other than new 
appearance and functionality. 

4. Equipment Quantities – AAPS, in its sole discretion, reserves the right to increase or 
decrease reasonable quantities by ten percent (10%) without affecting the bid price per 
unit. 

5. Equipment Design – Unless otherwise agreed in writing by the parties, all equipment 
shall be of current design and manufacture and shall reflect the latest advances in the 
state of the art to insure against early obsolescence.  All equipment shall meet latest 
OSHA and MI-OSHA standards. 

6. Equipment, Supplies and Materials Standards – Where one certain kind, type, or 
brand of manufacturer of equipment or materials is referenced; it is done to indicate the 
type of equipment desired and to establish the minimum acceptable standards of 
quality, performance, design, and efficiency.  This shall not be construed to mean that 
the certain type or brand indicated is the only one acceptable.  Other goods meeting or 
exceeding these standards will be given equal consideration unless otherwise noted. 

7. Instruction & Operation – Appropriate instruction manuals, service manuals, and 
parts lists (collectively, “materials literature”) for all equipment furnished by Bidder will 
be required at such time as any equipment is delivered to AAPS.  On-site instruction by 
Bidder for Ann Arbor Public School personnel who shall use the equipment will be 
required within one week of delivery of such equipment.  Bidder shall provide two (2) 
follow-up instructional visits, if requested by AAPS, within 120 days of acceptance of 
the equipment.  AAPS shall not be charged for any materials literature or instruction 
service. 

8. Delivery – In the event a good or service to be supplied by the Bidder is not delivered 
on the date specified on AAPS purchase order, such failure shall entitle AAPS to refuse 
acceptance of further deliveries of goods or to cancel its contract with Bidder in whole or 



 

in part.  All goods provided by Bidder must be delivered to AAPS between the working 
hours of 8:00 a.m. and 3:00 p.m. 

9. Freight Terms – F.O.B. delivered to stated location in Ann Arbor.  The exact 
quantities of the various goods to be delivered to each location will be covered by 
separate purchase order for each location to be issued to Bidder. 

10. Payment Terms.  Payment shall be made by AAPS within thirty (30) days of the 
latest of the date of the completion of delivery, the date of completion of installation of 
Bidder’s goods, or the date of the receipt of an original invoice at P.O. Box 1188, Ann 
Arbor, MI 48106.  

11. Bid Selection – Bidder acknowledges that AAPS shall select those bids by item that 
it considers to be in AAPS’ best interest.  AAPS reserves the right to (1) award a bid by 
line item, (2) accept or reject a bid in whole or in part, (3) qualify or disqualify bidders 
on the basis of available information pertaining to the suitability of the goods bid, and 
(4) delete a Bidder from the AAPS list of approved vendors if the Bidder does not 
comply with these Additional Terms and Conditions or does not respond to a Request 
for Quotation (“RFQ”) with either a bid or a “no bid” response.  

12. Meeting Specifications & Alternate Bids – Bidder shall submit bids which meet the 
bid specifications.  Bids, which do not meet specifications, must be marked “Alternate”.   
Any deviations from AAPS’ bid specifications must be noted in order for the Alternate 
Bid to receive consideration.   

13. Bid Bond – Security in the form of a certified check, cashier’s check, or bid bond is 
required in the amount of at least 5% of the total amount of construction bids in excess 
of the amount specified in M.C.L § 380.1267 or the comparable provision of future law.  
For non-construction bids, it is applicable only when the “Bid Bond Required” box is 
checked on page 1 of the RFQ.  All bond surety companies utilized by Bidder must be 
licensed in the State of Michigan. 

14. Non-Collusion – Bidder certifies that its bid has not been made or prepared in 
collusion or cooperation with any other bidder, or representative thereof, and the prices, 
terms, or conditions of the bid have not been communicated by or on behalf of Bidder to 
any other bidder or potential bidder and will not be so communicated to any other 
bidder or potential bidder prior to the official opening of this bid.  This certification may 
be treated for all purposes as if it were a sworn statement made under oath, subject to 
the penalties for perjury.   

15. Compliance with Regulations.  Bidder shall comply with the following: 

(a) Nondiscrimination.  Bidder, Bidder’s contractors and subcontractors may not 
discriminate against any employee or applicant for employment because of race, 
creed, color, gender, national origin, or age except where based on a bona fide 
occupational qualification.   

(b) Disclosure of Conflicts of Interest.  Bidder must disclose in writing whether, 
to its actual knowledge, any member of the AAPS Board of Education or any AAPS 
employee or member of the immediate family or a member of the AAPS Board of 
Education or the AAPS employee possesses a Financial Interest in Bidder or receives 
a benefit, bonus, commission, payment, consideration, or item of value from Bidder 



 

as a result of the transaction of business with AAPS.  Such written disclosure must 
be submitted to AAPS by Bidder with its initial bid.  If such conflict of interest is 
discovered subsequent to the submission of Bidder’s bid, written disclosure must be 
submitted to AAPS within seven (7) business days of discovery.  AAPS reserves the 
right to immediately terminate any contract with a Bidder upon the notification of a 
conflict of interest.  Upon such termination, AAPS shall compensate Bidder only for 
the value of any goods or services provided to AAPS prior to such termination. 

Addendum: 
 
 Competitive bids for construction of a new school building, or addition to or 
repair or renovation of an existing school building, shall be accompanied by a sworn 
and notarized statement disclosing any familial relationship that exists between the 
owner or any employee of the bidder and any member of the board of education or 
the superintendent.  The board of education shall not accept a bid that does not 
include this sworn and notarized disclosure statement (Refer to the Revised School 
Code Section 1267 effective July 21, 2004). 

 
(c) Definitions.  For purposes of this Section 15, the following definitions apply: 

(i) A “Financial Interest” shall be defined as a relationship wherein (1) 
an AAPS employee or a member of his or her immediate family is a partner, 
member, director, or officer of the Bidder or (2) the AAPS employee or his or 
her family member owns not less than one percent (1%) of any class of stock 
in the Bidder or an amount of stock having a total market value in excess of 
$25,000.00. 

(ii) “Domestic Partner” shall be defined as provided in Chapter 110 of 
the City Code of the City of Ann Arbor, as the same may be amended from 
time to time. 

(iii) “Immediate family” shall be defined as a spouse, the in-laws of a 
spouse, parent, the in-laws of a parent, child, the in-laws of a child, sibling, 
the in-laws of a sibling, grandparent, the in-laws of a grandparent, aunt, the 
in-laws of an aunt, uncle, the in-laws of an uncle, first cousin, the in-laws of a 
first cousin, the domestic partner, or any of the foregoing familial relations 
listed herein of the domestic partner of an AAPS employee.  

16. Purchase Order Requirements.  Any contract arising out of the bidding process shall 
become operative only upon the issuance of a written purchase order containing the 
signatures of the then current AAPS Purchasing and Finance Directors.  Every purchase 
order over the then existing State Bid Index Limit, as defined under the applicable state 
law and as the same may be amended from time to time, must be in writing and include 
a valid AAPS Board of Education annex number which may be obtained from the Board 
of Education Office. 

17. Invoices.  All original invoices sent by Bidder to AAPS must reference the 
identification number from the corresponding purchase order.  All of Bidder’s original 
invoices shall be sent to AAPS at:  P.O. Box 1188, Ann Arbor, Michigan 48106. 



 

18. Taxes.  AAPS is a federally constituted government body and is not subject to 
Michigan state or Federal excise tax.  If requested by bidder, AAPS will provide a signed 
Michigan Sales and Use Tax Certificate of Exemption form. 

19. Force Majeure – If the performance of any obligation of AAPS is prevented, delayed 
or in any way interfered with by force majeure, act of God, natural disaster, fire, flood, 
explosion, earthquake, epidemic, quarantine, restriction, serious accident, any act of 
government, insurrection, riot, strike, labor trouble, shortage of material or any other 
cause beyond the control of AAPS, AAPS may, at its sole option, suspend performance 
or cancel its obligations without liability for loss, provided AAPS informs the Bidder 
immediately in writing of its inability to carry out the terms of its obligations.  In no 
event will AAPS be responsible for consequential or special damages on account of such 
suspension of performance or canceling of obligations. 

20. Default by Bidder and Ann Arbor Public Schools Remedies.  In the event that Bidder 
defaults by failing, at any time, to comply with its obligations under the terms of any 
contract with AAPS, then AAPS reserves the right to immediately terminate any and all 
contracts with Bidder in whole or in part upon failure of Bidder to correct such 
default(s) within ten (10) days after written notice by AAPS to Bidder reasonably 
identifying such default(s) and the action(s) needed to correct such defaults.  Such right 
of termination is in addition to any other rights provided to AAPS under law or equity. 

21. Preemption.  In the event of conflicting provisions among the purchase order, AAPS’ 
bid specifications, the RFQ, these Additional Terms and Conditions, or Bidder’s bid 
documents, provisions from the following documents will control in the order listed 
herein: (a) the purchase order, (b) the bid specifications, (c) the RFQ, (d) these 
Additional Terms and Conditions, and (e) the Bidder’s bid documents.   

22. Effect of Price Quotes.  Any price quotes provided by Bidder for its goods shall be 
treated as for informational purposes only and not as an offer.  AAPS shall be treated 
as the offeror in all contracts between AAPS and Bidder. 

23. Assignment.  Bidder shall not have the right to assign or otherwise transfer its rights 
and obligations under the RFQ, these Additional Terms and Conditions, the purchase 
order, or the bid specification, except with the prior written consent of AAPS.  Any 
prohibited assignment shall be null and void. 

24. Notices.  Notices permitted or required to be given hereunder shall be deemed 
sufficient if given by registered or certified mail, postage prepaid, return receipt 
requested, addressed to the respective addresses of the parties at first above written or 
at such other addresses as the respective parties may designate by like notice from time 
to time.  Unless specified otherwise herein in connection with any particular notice, 
notices so given shall be effective upon receipt by the party to which notice is given.   

25. Amendment.  The RFQ, these Additional Terms and Conditions, the purchase order, 
the bid specifications, or the Bidder’s bid documents shall not be deemed or construed 
to be modified, amended, rescinded, canceled or waived, in whole or in part, except by 
written amendment signed by the parties hereto.  Such amendment shall be effective only 
upon issuance by AAPS of a revised purchase order and the conveyance of the same to 
the Bidder.  



 

26. Severability.  In the event that any of the provisions of the RFQ, these Additional 
Terms and Conditions, the purchase order, the bid specifications, or the Bidder’s bid 
documents are in conflict with any rules of law or statutory provision or are otherwise 
unenforceable under the laws or regulations of any government or subdivision thereof, 
such provisions shall be deemed stricken. 

27. Governing Law. Each contract between AAPS and the Bidder shall be governed 
under the laws of the State of Michigan. 
 
 
 
 
Revised:  June, 2008 
Reviewed by D. Comsa, HRS 
LND 



ANN ARBOR PUBLIC SCHOOLS (“AAPS”) 
SMALL/MINORITY BUSINESS SURVEY (Optional) 

 

Company Name:      

Address:      

City:  State:  Zip:  

Contact Person:    Phone:  

Date:      
 
 
 
Please use the guidelines below to determine the category. 
 
Minority Business – A Minority Business is defined as a business that is at least 51% owned by females, 
persons of a national origin minority group (e.g.: African-American, Alaskan, Middle Eastern, Eskimo, 
Hispanic, Native American, Asian), or qualified as a small business as established below. 
 

Is the above-listed firm a minority firm? Yes  No   

If yes, please check the appropriate groups(s):   

Female owned:  Native-American owned:  

 
 

African-American owned:  Hispanic owned:  

 

Other owned (specify):    
 
 
Small Business – The Small Business Act defines a small business as a concern that is organized for profit; 
has a place of business in the U.S.; operates primarily within the U.S. or makes a significant contribution to 
the U.S. economy through payment of taxes or use of American products, materials or labor; is 
independently owned and operated; and is not dominant in its field on a national basis. 
 

Industry Category # Of Employees Annual Gross Sales 

Manufacturing & Mining 500 N/A 

Wholesale trade 100 N/A 

Retail and service N/A Not to exceed $7,000,000 

General & Heavy Construction N/A Not to exceed $33,500,000 

Special Trade Contractors N/A Not to exceed $14,000,000 

Agricultural N/A Not to exceed $750,000 

 

Industry Category:     

Is the above-listed firm a small business? Yes  No  

Total Number of Employees:     

Number of Employees from Minority Groups: Male  Female  
 
 
 



 

Statement of NO BID 

 

 
 
If you do not intend to bid, please return this form only to: 
 

Ann Arbor Public Schools 
2555 South State Street 
Ann Arbor, MI  48104 
ATTN:  Mr. Robert Allen 
FAX #: 734-997-0145 
 
Description of Project: 
 
_____________________________________________________________________  
 
_____________________________________________________________________ 
 
We, the undersigned, decline to bid on the above project for the following reason(s): 
 

__ We are not able to respond to the Invitation to Bid or Request for Proposals by 
the specified deadline. 

 
__ Our company/firm does not offer this product or service. 
 

__ Our schedule will not permit us to perform. 
 
__ Specifications are incomplete or information is unclear (Please explain below). 
 

____________________________________________________________________ 
 
____________________________________________________________________ 
 

__ Other (Please specify below) 
 
____________________________________________________________________ 
 
  
Company Name ___________________________________ Phone _____________ 
 
 
Print name of person completing this form: _________________________________ 
 
 
Date:______________  Signed:   _______________________________ 
 
 

   


